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Excerpts from Neil Postman’s Amusing Ourselves to Death: 
Public Discourse in the Age of Show Business (1985) 

 
 

We were keeping our eye on 1984. When the 
year came and the prophecy didn’t, thoughtful 
Americans sang softly in praise of themselves. 
The roots of liberal democracy had held. 
Wherever else the terror had happened, we, at 
least, had not been visited by Orwellian 
nightmares. 

But we had forgotten that alongside Orwell’s 
dark vision, there was another - slightly older, 
slightly less well known, equally chilling: Aldous 
Huxley’s Brave New World. Contrary to common 
belief even among the educated, Huxley and 
Orwell did not prophesy the same thing. Orwell 
warns that we will be overcome by an externally 
imposed oppression. But in Huxley’s vision, no 
Big Brother is required to deprive people of their 
autonomy, maturity and history. As he saw it, 
people will come to love their oppression, to 
adore the technologies that undo their capacities 
to think. 

What Orwell feared were those who would 
ban books. What Huxley feared was that there 
would be no reason to ban a book, for there 
would be no one who wanted to read one. Orwell 
feared those who would deprive us of 
information. Huxley feared those who would 
give us so much that we would be reduced to 
passivity and egoism. Orwell feared that the 
truth would be concealed from us. Huxley feared 
the truth would be drowned in a sea of 
irrelevance. Orwell feared we would become a 
captive culture. Huxley feared we would become 
a trivial culture, preoccupied with some 
equivalent of the feelies, the orgy porgy, and the 
centrifugal bumblepuppy. As Huxley remarked 
in Brave New World Revisited, the civil 
libertarians and rationalists who are ever on the 
alert to oppose tyranny “failed to take into 
account man’s almost infinite appetite for 
distractions.” In 1984, Orwell added, people are 
controlled by inflicting pain. In Brave New World, 
they are controlled by inflicting pleasure. In 
short, Orwell feared that what we fear will ruin 

us. Huxley feared that what we desire will ruin 
us. 

This book is about the possibility that Huxley, 
not Orwell, was right. (xix-xx) 
 

The clearest way to see through a culture is 
to attend to its tools for conversation. (8) 
 

I use the word ‘conversation’ metaphorically 
to refer not only to speech but to all techniques 
and technologies that permit people of a 
particular culture to exchange messages. … Our 
attention here is on how forms of public 
discourse regulate and even dictate what kind of 
content can issue from such forms. To take a 
simple example of what this means, consider the 
primitive technology of smoke signals. While I 
do not know exactly what content was once 
carried in the smoke signals of American 
Indians, I can safely guess that it did not include 
philosophical argument. Puffs of smoke are 
insufficiently complex to express ideas on the 
nature of existence, and even if they were not, a 
Cherokee philosopher would run short of either 
wood or blankets long before he reached his 
second axiom. You cannot use smoke to do 
philosophy. Its form excludes the content. (6-7) 
 

[T]he concept of truth is intimately linked to 
the biases of forms of expression. Truth does not, 
and never has, come unadorned. It must appear 
in its proper clothing or it is not acknowledged, 
which is a way of saying that the “truth” is a kind 
of cultural prejudice. Each culture conceives of it 
as being most authentically expressed in certain 
symbolic forms that another culture may regard 
as trivial or irrelevant. (23) 
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 (24) 
 

(29) 
 

 
(41-42) 
 

[In the eighteenth and nineteenth centuries], 
the use of language as a means of complex 
argument was an important, pleasurable, and 
common form of discourse in almost every 
public arena. (47) 
 

In a culture dominated by print, public 
discourse tends to be characterized by a 
coherent, orderly arrangement of facts and 
ideas. The public for whom it is intended is 
generally competent to manage such discourse. 
In a print culture, writers make mistakes when 
they lie, contradict themselves, fail to support 
their generalizations, try to enforce illogical 
connections. In print culture, readers make 
mistakes when they don’t notice, or even worse, 
don’t care. (51) 
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(60) 
 

Almost all the characteristics we associate 
with mature discourse were amplified by 
typography, which has the strongest possible 
bias toward exposition: a sophisticated ability to 
think conceptually, deductively and sequentially; 
a high valuation of reason and order; an 
abhorrence of contradiction; a large capacity for 
detachment and objectivity; and a tolerance for 
delayed response. (63) 
 

(65) 
 

 
(67) 
 

[Y]ou may get a sense of what is meant by 
context-free information by asking yourself the 
following question: How often does it occur that 
information provided you on morning radio or 
television, or in the morning newspaper, causes 
you to alter your plans for the day, or to take 
some action you would not otherwise have 
taken, or provides insight into some problem 
you are required to solve? For most of us, news 
of the weather will sometimes have such 
consequences; for investors, news of the stock 
market; perhaps and occasional story about a 
crime will do it, if by chance the crime occurred 
near where you live in or involved someone you 
know. But most of our daily news is inert, 
consisting of information that gives us 
something to talk about but cannot lead to any 
meaningful action. This fact is the principal 
legacy of the telegraph: By generating an 
abundance of irrelevant information, it 
dramatically altered what may be called the 
“information-action ratio.” In both oral and 
typographic cultures, information derives its 
importance from the possibilities of action. (68) 
 

The news elicits from you a variety of 
opinions about which you can do nothing except 
to offer them as more news, about which you can 
do nothing. (69) 
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(75) 
 

I will try to argue that television’s 
conversations promote incoherence and 
triviality; that the phrase “serious television” is a 
contradiction in terms; and that television 
speaks only in one persistent voice – the voice of 
entertainment. (80) 
 

 
(76) 
 

But what I am claiming here is not that 
television is entertaining but that it has made 
entertainment itself the natural format for the 
representation of all experience. Our television 
set keeps us in constant communion with the 
world. But it does so with a face whose smiling 
countenance is unalterable. The problem is not 
that television presents us with entertaining 
subject matter but that all subject matter is 
presented as entertaining, which is another issue 
altogether.  

To say it still another way: Entertainment is 
the supra-ideology of all discourse on television. 
No matter what is depicted or from what point of 
view, the overarching presumption is that it is 
there for our amusement and pleasure. That is 
why even on news shows which provide us daily 
with fragments of tragedy and barbarism, we are 
urged by the newscasters to ‘join them 
tomorrow.’ What for? One would think that 
several minutes of murder and mayhem would 
suffice as material for a month of sleepless 
nights. We accept the newscasters’ invitation 
because we know that the ‘news’ is not to be 
taken seriously, that it is all in fun, so to say. 
Everything about a news show tells us this--- the 
good looks and amiability of the cast, their 
pleasant banter, the exciting music that opens 
and closes the show, the vivid film footage, the 
attractive commercials – all these and more 
suggest that what we have just seen is no cause 
for weeping. A news show, to put it plainly, is a 
format for entertainment, not for education, 
reflection, or catharsis. And we must not judge 
too harshly those who have framed it in this way. 
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They are not assembling the news to be read, or 
broadcasting it to be heard. They are televising 
the news to be seen. They must follow where 
their medium leads. There is no conspiracy here, 
no lack of intelligence, only a straightforward 
recognition that ‘good television’ has little to do 
with what is ‘good’ about exposition or other 
forms of verbal communication but everything 
to do with what the pictorial images look like. 
(87-88) 
 

It is not merely that on the television screen 
entertainment is the metaphor for all discourse. 
It is that off the screen the same metaphor 
prevails. As typography once dictated the style of 
conducting politics, religion, business, education, 
law and other important social matters, 
television now takes command. In courtrooms, 
classrooms, operating rooms, board rooms, 
churches and even airplanes, Americans no 
longer talk to each other, they entertain each 
other. They do not exchange ideas; they 
exchange images. They do not argue with 
propositions; they argue with good looks, 
celebrities, and commercials. (92-93) 

 
For those who think I am here guilty of 

hyperbole, I offer the following description of 
television news by Robert MacNeil, executive 
director and co-anchor of the “MacNeil-Lehrer 
News-Hour.” The idea, he writes, “is to keep 
everything brief, not to strain the attention of 
anyone but instead to provide constant 
stimulation through variety, novelty, action, and 
movement. You are required … to pay attention 
to no concept, no character, and no problem for 
more than a few seconds at a time.” … [He says 
that] “bite-sized is best, that complexity must be 
avoided, that nuances are dispensable, 
qualifications impede the simple message, that 
visual stimulation is a substitute for thought, and 
that verbal precision is an anachronism.” (105) 
 

I do not mean that the trivialization of public 
information is all accomplished on television. I 
mean that television is the paradigm for our 
conception of public information. As the printing 
press did in an earlier time, television has 

achieved the power to define the form in which 
news must come, and it has also defined how we 
shall respond to it. In presenting news to us 
packaged as vaudeville, television induces other 
media to do the same, so that the total 
information environment begins to mirror 
television. (111) 
 

Show business is not entirely without an idea 
of excellence, but its main business is to please 
the crowd, and its principal instrument is 
artifice. If politics is like show business, then the 
idea is not to pursue excellence, clarity or 
honesty but to appear as if you are, which is 
another matter altogether. And what the other 
matter is can be expressed in one word: 
advertising. (126) 
 

The commercial asks us to believe that all 
problems are solvable, that they are solvable 
fast, and that they are solvable fast through the 
interventions of technology, techniques and 
chemistry. This is, of course, a preposterous 
theory about the roots of discontent, and would 
appear so to anyone hearing or reading it. But 
the commercial disdains exposition, for that 
takes time and invites argument. (130-31) 
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(136-37) 
 
If we are to blame “Sesame Street” for 

anything, it is for the pretense that it is an ally of 
the classroom. That, after all, has been its chief 
claim on foundation and public money. As a 
television show, and a good one, “Sesame Street” 
does not encourage children to love school or 
anything about school. It encourages them to 
love television. (144) 
 

 
(143) 
 

Tyrants of all varieties have always known 
about the value of providing the masses with 
amusements as a means of pacifying discontent. 
But most of them could not have even hoped for 
a situation in which the masses would ignore 
that which does not amuse. That is why tyrants 
have always relied, and still do, on censorship. 
Censorship, after all, is the tribute tyrants pay to 
the assumption that a public knows the 
difference between serious discourse and 
entertainment – and cares. How delightful would 
be all the kings, czars, and führers of the past to 
know that censorship is not a necessity when all 
political discourse takes the form of a jest. (141) 
 

 

(157-58) 
 

Television, as I have implied earlier, serves 
us most usefully when presenting junk-
entertainment; it serves us most ill when it co-
opts serious modes of discourse – news, politics, 
science, education, commerce, religion – and 
turns them into entertainment packages. We 
would all be better off if television got worse, not 
better. (159) 
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